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Quaststraat 4
Location:  Oranjestad

Price:  353000 USD

Bathrooms:  2

Bedrooms:  3
 

Lot size:  450 m2

Built up size:  154 m2

Introducing our latest real estate property, a newly built home
designed to offer comfort, convenience, and modern living. This
exceptional property features three spacious bedrooms and two
bathrooms, providing ample space for a growing family or
individuals seeking a comfortable living environment.Situated on a
generous land size of 450 square meters (approx. 4840 sq.ft) , this
property offers plenty of outdoor space for relaxation,
entertainment, and potential expansion. With a built-up area of 154
square meters (approx. 1655 sq.ft), the interior layout is
meticulously planned to maximize functionality and optimize the use
of available space.Constructed in 2021, this home boasts the
advantage of being newly built, ensuring a contemporary design and
modern amenities. The lot is Property, allowing for greater flexibility
and ownership benefits.Location is paramount, and this home excels
in this aspect. Conveniently positioned close to a wide array of
entertainment and recreational activities, residents will have easy
access to various amenities such as shopping centers, restaurants,
parks, and cultural attractions. Whether you seek a vibrant nightlife,
family-friendly outings, or serene outdoor spaces, this property's
location offers a multitude of options to cater to your lifestyle
preferences.We invite you to explore this exceptional real estate
opportunity and discover the perfect combination of comfortable
living, modern design, and convenient location. Don't miss the
chance to make this newly built, three-bedroom, two-bathroom
home your own. 
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