
Berkshire Hathaway HomeServices Aruba Realty
Website: bhhsaruba.com | Office number: +(297) 280-0047 | Email: info@bhhsaruba.com

Copyright © 2025 Berkshire Hathaway HomeServices Aruba Realty, LLC

An independently owned and operated franchisee of BHH Affiliates, LLC.

Palma Real Villa 4
Location:  Palm Beach

Price:  2600 USD

Bathrooms:  3

Bedrooms:  3
 

Introducing Palma Real 4, the epitome of elegance and convenience,
offering an ideal residence for directors, U.S. Customs personnel,
and discerning families alike. This two-story haven features three
bedrooms and three baths, ensuring a perfect blend of privacy and
communal living.As you enter the property, you'll immediately
notice the thoughtful layout, with one bedroom conveniently
located on the lower level for added accessibilityVenture upstairs to
discover the other two bedrooms, each boasting its own private
bathroom, creating a harmonious balance between personal space
and shared comfort..Step outside into the inviting ambiance of your
own outdoor oasis. A well-appointed grill area beckons for al fresco
dining, perfect for entertaining guests or enjoying quality family
time under the gazebo. The property is not only a retreat but a
culinary haven for those who appreciate outdoor cooking.Security is
paramount in the Palma Real community, with 24/7 surveillance
ensuring peace of mind for residents and providing an extra layer of
protection. Whether you're a director with a demanding schedule, a
member of the U.S. Customs team, or a family seeking a secure and
welcoming home, Palma Real 4 is designed to meet your unique
needs.Enhancing the lifestyle quotient are two community adult
pools, creating an inviting atmosphere for relaxation and socializing.
Additionally, a dedicated kids' pool ensures that younger members
of the family have a safe and enjoyable space to splash and
play.Palma Real 4 represents more than just a residence; it
embodies a lifestyle that seamlessly integrates comfort, security,
and community. This property is not just a place to live; it's a
sanctuary that caters to the diverse needs of those who seek a
refined and convenient living experience. Welcome to Palma Real 4
– where luxury meets practicality in the heart of your new
home.Please note that the price is based on 1 year contract.
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