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L.G. Smith Boulevard 532 E
Location:  Malmok

Price:  3200000 USD

Bathrooms:  5

Bedrooms:  5
 

Lot size:  1.225 m2

Virtual 3D
Tour:https://my.matterport.com/show/?m=pednEX2S7MtDiscover
luxury living in Malmok, Aruba, with our new exclusive listing. This
magnificent home offers a lifetime of breathtaking sunsets and
unparalleled comfort, perfectly situated in one of Aruba's most
prestigious neighborhoods. Close to a few of the most popular
beaches on the island. Just a 3 min walk, and you will have your toes
in the sand.Bedrooms & Bathrooms: This home boasts 5 elegant
bedrooms and 5 full bathrooms, plus 2 additional guest restrooms
inside and 1 outside by the pool area, ensuring privacy and
convenience for you and your guests.Kitchen & Living Spaces:
Experience the charm of the house with an open kitchen located on
the second floor, seamlessly flowing into a large living room. This
central gathering area opens to a spacious balcony, ideal for
entertaining or quiet evenings enjoying the serene views.Unique
Design: A stunning spiral staircase leads to a unique upper patio
deck with commanding views of the entire island “Crow’s Nest”.
With a food elevator for morning coffees or sunset cocktails. Perfect
place for endless sunsets and relaxation awaits.Climate Control:
Centralized air-conditioning ensures your comfort in Aruba’s sunny
climate.Garden & Outdoors: The property is surrounded by a
meticulously maintained garden, complete with a drip system to
keep it lush and vibrant. The pool is generously sized for laps or
leisure and is complemented by an outdoor kitchen and BBQ
area.Additional Amenities: A garage and laundry area, with two
remote-controlled gates offers secure and convenient access. All
windows are sourced from Anderson Windows and Doors, known
for their quality and durability. This property is not just a home; it's a
sanctuary designed for those who appreciate the finer things in life.
Contact us today to schedule a viewing and see firsthand why this
luxury home in Malmok the perfect setting for your new
beginning.Lot Size 1225 m2Ground Floor (Front Entrance and
Garage) 192 m2First Floor 199 m2Balcony 53 m2Back Terrace 25
m2Outdoor Kitchen 15 m2Roof Terrace 20 m2Charles Croes -
Purple Elite GroupReal Estate Professional(297) 280-0047 (297)
593-6033charles.croes@bhhsaruba.comDarienne Arends - Purple
Elite GroupReal Estate Professional(297) 280-0047 (297) 592-
5821darienne.arends@bhhsaruba.com
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